
 
 
Environmental Information Regulations – Response – 26720  
 
I am requesting information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000. 
For the Lake Lothing Third Crossing, please provide the total amount the Council has 
spent on the Development Consent Order (DCO) process, broken down by reporting 
period, from 13 July 2016 (or the earliest records held, if you do not hold records back to 
that date) to the most recent figures available. 
Please: 
1. Include costs incurred during pre-application, application, pre-examination and 
examination (and any other DCO-related stage you record). 
2. Provide the breakdown by the reporting periods you hold (e.g. financial year / quarter). 
3. State whether figures are inclusive or exclusive of VAT (and provide both if held). 
4. Provide the data in a machine-readable format (CSV/Excel is fine). 
Suffolk County Council do not hold the amount spent on the Development Consent Order 
process specifically and so cannot provide a response to this request. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 


