
 
 
 
Freedom of Information – Response – 26692 
 
Could you please answer the following questions? 
 
Children’s services 
 
1.  How many staff were employed at children’s centres and family hubs operated, 
overseen or commissioned by your council in the financial year a) 2010/11 b) 2015/16 c) 
2020/21 d) 2024/25? 
Suffolk County Council (SCC)’s directorate for Children and Young People’s services 
(CYP) do not hold the information as requested for a and b.  We can provide information 
for c and d. 

  No of Staff period 

2010/11 Not available Prior to CC integration into Community Health 

2015/16 Not available Prior to CC integration into Community Health 

2020/21 174 as at April 2020 

2024/25 169 as at April 2024 

 

2.  How many FTE staff were employed by your council to deliver child and adolescent 
mental health services in the financial years a) 2010/11 b) 2015/16 c) 2020/21 d) 2024/25? 
CYP do not hold this information as these services are delivered by NSFT. 

Women’s Refuges 

 

1.  How many women's refuges did your local council directly provide in the financial years 
a) 2010/11 b) 2015/16 c) 2020/21 d) 2024/25? 

None provided directly  

2.  How many women's refuges provided by external organisations did your council 
provide funding for in the financial years a) 2010/11 b) 2015/16 c) 2020/21 d) 2024/25? 
SCC’s directorate for Public Health and Communities (PH&C) – Reply: 
a) 2010/11 - Not in PH&C  
b) 2015/16 - Not in PH&C 
c) 3  
d) 3  
 

3.  How much funding for women’s refuges provided by external organisations did your 
council provide in the financial years a) 2010/11 b) 2015/16 c) 2020/21 d) 2024/25? 
a) 2010/11 - Not in PH&C  
b) 2015/16 - £290,042  
c) 2020/21 - £348,464  
d) 2024/25 - £388,095  
 

4.  How many FTE staff were employed by your council to deliver domestic abuse services 



and victim support in a) 2010/11 b) 2015/16 c) 2020/21 d) 2024/25? 

PH&C: No staff provide services or support directly to victims– roles are strategic / 
commissioning / project management.  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 


