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Public health services

1. How many children received childhood obesity public health service support in the
financial years

a) 2015/16

b) 2020/21

Suffolk County Council (SCC) does not hold this information. Searches have been carried
however, no data has been found.

c) 2024/25
In the Children’s Healthy Living Service, 164 children had an allocated worker (on a
caseload).

2. Does your council provide a weight management service for children? If not, when did
this service cease to be provided?
Yes

3. How many staff supported your weight management service for children in the financial
years

a) 2015/16

SCC does not hold this information. Searches have been carried however; no data has
been found.

b) 2020/21
7 FTE staff

c) 2024/25
8 FTE staff

4. How many children in your council area participated in the National Child Measurement
Programme in the financial years

a) 2015/16

Reception 7940, Year 6 7164

b) 2020/21
Reception 6210, Year 6 2360

c) 2024/25
Reception 6730, Year 6 7420

5. How many 0-5 year old children received speech and language service support in the
financial years a) 20156/16 b) 2020/21 c) 2024/25
A — Speech and Language services for 0-5-year-old children are provided by the NHS.



However, we are aware of occasions where Suffolk County Council (Children’s and Young
People/CYP) have provided access to an independent SALT provider and where the
provider was paid in these circumstances.

2015/2016 -0
2020/2021 -0
2024/2025 - <5

6. How many air monitors were deployed in your council area in the financial years a)
2015/16 b) 2020/21 c) 2024/25

Responsibility for air quality monitoring in areas of two-tier local government sits with lower
tier local authorities. This means that in Suffolk, air quality monitoring is carried out by the
respective borough and district councils who report their monitoring activities every year
within their Annual Status Reports. These reports include locations and readings of
monitors within their area and are published on their respective local authority websites.

Historic reports covering all the requested periods should still be available on their
websites, but if not, these can be requested by contacting the relevant council directly.

e Babergh Mid Suffolk District Council
Freedom of Information - Babergh District Council - babergh.gov.uk / midsuffolk.gov.uk

e East Suffolk
https://www.eastsuffolk.gov.uk/home/SearchForm/?url=/home/SearchForm&Search=freed
om+of+information&fo=8&action results=Go

e West Suffolk
https://www.westsuffolk.gov.uk/Council/Data-and-information/freedom-of-information.cfm

e Ipswich Borough Council
https://www.ipswich.gov.uk/search?s=freedom+of+information

7. How many air monitors were deployed outside schools in your council area in the
financial years a) 20156/16 b) 2020/21 c) 2024/25

8. How many air monitors were deployed outside nurseries in your council area in the
financial years a) 20156/16 b) 2020/21 c) 2024/25

As above


https://www.babergh.gov.uk/web/babergh/freedom-of-information?p_l_back_url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.babergh.gov.uk%2F
https://www.eastsuffolk.gov.uk/home/SearchForm/?url=/home/SearchForm&Search=freedom+of+information&fo=8&action_results=Go
https://www.eastsuffolk.gov.uk/home/SearchForm/?url=/home/SearchForm&Search=freedom+of+information&fo=8&action_results=Go
https://www.westsuffolk.gov.uk/Council/Data-and-information/freedom-of-information.cfm
https://www.ipswich.gov.uk/search?s=freedom+of+information




